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Does the Child have a                      
life-threatening allergy/disability 
related to consuming milk?  

 

District/school is not required to 
accommodate this child. 

 

Will the district/school elect to 
voluntarily accommodate such 
situations?  

District has decided not to make 
accommodations for non-life 
threatening conditions. Milk 
substitutions are not allowed in this 
situation. 

District/school may decide to 
voluntarily accommodate non-life-
threatening milk substitution 
requests. A Medical Statement for 
Meal Modifications must be 
completed and signed by a parent, 
physician, or recognized medical 
authority.    

A fluid dairy or non-dairy 
substitution may be made. Fluid 
dairy (1% or skim lactose-free or 
lactose-reduced) are acceptable 
substitutions. Non-dairy products 
must meet the nutrient 
specifications outlined by the USDA.  

Juice or water is not an allowable 
substitution. 

 

School is required to accommodate 
a child with a disability. A Medical 
Statement for Disabilities form must 
be completed and signed by a 
licensed physician.  

Whatever the physician prescribes 
as a milk substitution must be 
served. (may include juice or water)   

 

 
Policy Flow Chart 

Milk Substitution for Children with Disabilities & 
for Children with Special Dietary Needs (non-disability) 

 
 


